
 
ANNUAL SUPPLY CONTRACT FOR  

INSECTICIDES FOR MOSQUITO CONTROL  
BID NUMBER 2025.01 

 
 
 
 
 

AWARD 

November 13, 2024 
 
 
 
November 13, 2024, Calhoun County Commissioners Court awarded the bids for the Annual 
Supply Contract for Insecticides for Mosquito Control for the period beginning January 1, 2025 
and ending December 31, 2025.  
 

See Bid Tabulation for Awarded Bids 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  



Calhoun County, Texas

BID ITEM UNIT ADAPCO LLC                                                 

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL 

PRODUCTS INC                                  

RENTOKIL NORTH AMERICA, INC.                           

dba TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS                      ES OPCO USA LLC, dba VESERIS

BVA 13 or Calpar 80 ULV Mineral Oil                                    ENVIROTECH MINERAL OIL  BVA 13 ULV                                                                                                                                                               MAXPAR G2-60 (55 GAL) 

2.5 Gallon Jug NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5 Gallon Pail $98.70 NO BID $89.00 NO BID

50 Gallon Drum $962.50 $1,141.20 $600.00 $525.00 

55 Gallon Drum $1,058.75 $1,223.20 $655.00 $577.52 

275 Gallon Tote $5,395.75 $6,872.80 $3,080.00 $2,884.75 

1000 Gallons Bulk $10.10 PER GALLON 

BID ITEM #2:  MALATHION           

or Equivalent

Fyfanon ULV  Mosquito                                                        

Active Ingredients:  Malathion 96.5%; 

other 3.5%                                                                                                    

Fyfanon ULV                                                

Active Ingredient: Malathion 96.5%

2 x 2.5 Gallon Case $483.65 NO BID NO BID $469.59 

5 Gallon Pail NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

55 Gallon Drum $5,064.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

260 Gallon Tote $23,197.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

1000 or + gallons $63.20 PER GALLON 

BID ITEM #3:  MALATHION EW 

or Equivalent
Fyfanon EW Mosquito                                                      

Active Ingredients:  Malathion                 

Malathion 5 EC                                                         

Active Ingredient: Malathion 

2.5 Gallon Jug $195.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID

2 x 2.5 Gallon Case NO BID NO BID $350.00 NO BID

30 Gallon Drum NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

50 Gallon Drum 

$3,692.00                                                                                        

* Fyfanon EW is now packaged 50 

gallons in a 55 gl drum NO BID NO BID NO BID

AWARD                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            

Awarded Bids are Highlighted in Yellow

BID TABULATION - ANNUAL SUPPLY CONTRACT FOR INSECTICIDES FOR MOSQUITO CONTROL, BID NUMBER: 2025.01  -  ALL PRECINCTS

For Period Beginning JANUARY 1, 2025 and Ending DECEMBER 31, 2025

BID ITEM #1:  MINERAL OIL                                     

BVA Mosquito Larvicide Oil - 

MC30 or Equivalent
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BID ITEM UNIT ADAPCO LLC                                                        

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL 

PRODUCTS INC                                  

RENTOKIL NORTH AMERICA, INC.                           

dba TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS                                             ES OPCO USA LLC, dba VESERIS

BID ITEM #4:  30-30 ULV                     

or Equivalent            

PermaSease 30-30                                      

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 30.0%; 

Piperonyl Butoxide 30.0%                                     

PERM-X UL 30-30                                          

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 30.0%; 

Piperonyl Butoxide 30.0%                                                                         

 Permanone 30-30 (5 gal, 30 gal and 275 gal)                         

Perm-X UL 30-30 (2x2.5 gal)                                               

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 30.0%;              

Piperonyl Butoxide 30.0%                                           

MASTERLINE                                                           

KONTROL 30-30 / PERM-X UL 30-30                                        

Active Ingredients: Permethrin: 30%; 

Piperonyl Butoxide 30%

2 x 2.5 Gallon Case $430.00 $564.50 $459.20 $446.42

5 Gallon Pail NO BID NO BID $453.60 NO BID

30 Gallon Drum $2,599.80 $3,234.00 $2,610.00 $2,557.14

55 Gallon Drum NO BID NO BID NO BID $4,865.00

275 Gallon Tote $24,158.75 $29,645.00 $23,512.50 $23,682.86

BID ITEM #5:  31-66 ULV                     

or Equivalent

Perm-X UL 31-66                                                

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 31%; 

Piperonyl Butoxide 66%

Permanone 31-66 &                                                

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 31.28%;                  

Piperonyl Butoxide 66%                                                                                               

PERM-X UL 31-66                                           

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 31%; 

Piperonyl Butoxide 66% 

4 x 1 Gallon Case NO BID NO BID $600.00 NO BID

2 x 2.5 Gallon Case NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

30 Gallon Drum NO BID $5,040.00 $4,200.00 $4,800.00

30 Gallon Drum

$3,673.54                                                        

*30 gallon drums special pricing on 

limited stock. While supplies last 

275 Gallon Tote NO BID $46,200.00 $38,830.00 $44,000.00

BID ITEM #6:  31-67 ULV                   

or Equivalent               

PermaSease 31-67                                          

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 31.15%; 

Piperonyl Butoxide 66.85%                                     

MASTERLINE KONTROL 31-67                   

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 31.15%; 

Piperonyl Butoxide Technical* 66.85%

4 x 1 Gallon Case NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2 x 2.5 Gallon Case $746.65 NO BID NO BID $866.62

30 Gallon Drum $4,479.90 NO BID NO BID $5,199.98

275 Gallon Tote $41,065.75 NO BID NO BID $47,670.23

BID ITEM #7:  4-4 ULV                           

or Equivalent

PermaSease 4-4 (4.6% Permethrin)                                                

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 4.0%;       

Piperonyl butoxide 4.0%                                     

Perm-X UL 4-4                                                                   

Active Ingredients: Premethrin 4%; 

Piperonyl Butoxide 4%

Perm-X UL 4-4                                                             

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 4%;                         

Piperonyl Butoxide 4%                                             

MASTERLINE KONTROL 4-4                              

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 4.0%; 

Piperonyl Butoxide 4.0%

2 x 2.5 Gallon Case $160.00 $220.00 $190.50 $120.71

30 Gallon Tote NO BID NO BID NO BID $697.29

55 Gallon Drum $1,870.00 $1,848.00 $1,591.75 $1,257.14

275 Gallon Tote $7,920.00 $9,240.00 $7,850.00 $6,089.29
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BID ITEM UNIT ADAPCO LLC                                                          

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL 

PRODUCTS INC                                  

RENTOKIL NORTH AMERICA, INC.                           

dba TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS                                             ES OPCO USA LLC, dba VESERIS

BID ITEM #8:  4-8 ULV                             

or Equivalent                                               

Permanone Ready To Use                                                            

Active Ingredients: Permethrin 3.98%;                     

Piperonyl Butoxide 8.48%                                           

2 x 2.5 Gallon Case NO BID NO BID $276.50 NO BID

30 Gallon Tote NO BID NO BID $1,581.00 NO BID

55 Gallon Drum NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

275 Gallon Tote NO BID NO BID $12,718.75 NO BID

BID ITEM #9:  ALTOSID 30 DAY 

BRIQUETS  or Equivalent                                           

Altosid 30-Day Briquets                                                                            

Active Ingredients:                                           

(S)-Methoprene 8.62%                          

Altosid 30 Day Briquets                                                                   

Active Ingredients:                                                          

(S)-Methoprene 8.62%                                   

Altosid Briquets                                               

Active Ingredients:                                                         

(S)-Methoprene 8.62%

400 Per Case NO BID $552.00 $552 - Awarded 2nd $552 - Awarded 3rd

100 Per Case NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100 Per Case                                  

Buy 10 or more cases NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID 

BID ITEM #10  ALTOSID XR 

EXTENDED RESIDUAL BRIQUETS - 

Altosid XR Briquets or 

Equivalent                

Altosid XR Briquets                                                                           

Active Ingredients:                                            

(S)-Methoprene 2.1%

Altosid XR Extended Residual Briquets                                                                              

Active Ingredients:                                                                  

(S)-Methoprene 2.1%                                                 

Altosid XR Extended Residual Briquets                                                                              

Active Ingredients:                                                                  

(S)-Methoprene 2.1%                                                 

220 Per Case NO BID $866.80 - Awarded 3rd $866.80 - Awarded 2nd $866.80 

BID ITEM #11:  DELTAGARD           

or Equivalent
DeltaGard / Imperium                                                                                             

Active Ingredients: Deltamethrin 2.0%                                                                            

2 x 2.5 Gallon Case NO BID NO BID $1,430.00 NO BID

55 Gallons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

30 Gallon Drum NO BID NO BID $8,370.00 NO BID

250 Gallon Drum(Tote) NO BID NO BID $69,250.00 NO BID

BID ITEM #12 (45 Day):  

FOURSTAR SUSTAINED RELEASE 

45 DAY MICROBIAL BRIQUETS 

or Equivalent

  Fourstar 45/90/180 Day Briquets 
Active Ingredients: Bacillus Sphaericus 6%; 

Bacillus Thuringiensis Subspecies Israelensis 

1%

45 Day --- 200 Per Case NO BID $338.00 NO BID NO BID

BID ITEM #12 (90 Day):  

FOURSTAR SUSTAINED RELEASE 

90 DAY MICROBIAL BRIQUETS 

or Equivalent 90 Day --- 200 Per Case NO BID $562.00 NO BID NO BID

BID ITEM #12 (180 Day): 

FOURSTAR SUSTAINED RELEASE 

180 DAY MICROBIAL BRIQUETS 

or Equivalent 180 Day --- 200 Per Case NO BID $876.00 NO BID NO BID
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BID ITEM UNIT ADAPCO LLC                                                          

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL 

PRODUCTS INC                                  

RENTOKIL NORTH AMERICA, INC.                           

dba TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS                                             ES OPCO USA LLC, dba VESERIS

BID ITEM #13:                                   

REMOA TRI 
Active Ingredients: 4.0% Fenpropathrin; 

1.5% Abamectin; 1.0% C-8910                                

30 Gallon Drum $9,000.00

BID ITEM #14: VECTOBAC 12AS 

STRAIN AM 65-52 Active Ingredients: 11.61% Bti                                      

2 x 2.5 Gallon Case $208.45

30 Gallon Drum $1,250.70

BID ITEM #15: FALLOUT LQ AND 

FALLOUT WDG 2 x 2.5 Gallon 

$190.00 Per Case (Case = 2x2.5 Gallon Jugs) 

(Fallout LQ)

30 Gallon Drum 
$1,140.00 Per Drum (Drum = 30 Gallons) 

(Fallout LQ)

25 lb Drum 
$662.50 Per Drum (Drum=25lbs) (Fallout 

WDG)

BID ITEM #16: SUMILARV 0.5G 

AND SUMILARV WSP 10 X 1 kg Case 
$478.00 Per Case (Case = 10x1 kg Bags) 

(SumiLarv 0.5G)

2 x 5 kg Case 
$475.72 Per Case (Case = 2x5 kg Bags) 

(SumiLarv 0.5G)

20 kg Drum $951.46 Per 20kg Drum (Sumilarv 0.5G)

Case of 400 Pouches 
$659 Per Case (Case = 400 pouches) 

(Sumilarv WSP)

BID ITEM #17: NATULAR 

LARVICIDE: NATULAR G30 WSP
Natular G30 WSP                                                                  

Active Ingredient: Spinosad 2.5%

500 Per Case $481.28

BID ITEM #18: SUMMIT BTI 

BRIQUETS

Active Ingredients:                                                                               

Bacillus thuringiensis subspecies israelensis 

10.31%

100 PK $108.00 PER PACKAGE

6 PK $9.13 PER PACKAGE 

2 PK $5.95 PER PACKAGE 

BID ITEM #19:  EVERGREEN ULV 

5-25 GROUND  

Active Ingredients:                                                                              

Pyrethrin 5% + PBO 25% (rotational 

product, no OP odor, no corrosion) 

55 GALLON DRUM $11,705.88

REMARKS BY BIDDER REMARKS BY BIDDER REMARKS BY BIDDER REMARKS BY BIDDER

None 

Calibrations, droplet sizing, routine 

service is covered for customers. 

Products and equipment can be 

purchased via BuyBoard contract 709-

23.

None None

ADDITIONAL BID ITEMS
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